



1000 West Eighth Street - P.O. Box 3033 - Gillette, Wyoming 82717-3033
 (307) 682-5171 - Fax: (307) 682-6619

Richard M. Strahorn, Ed.D
 Superintendent of Schools

Alex Ayers, Ed.D
 Associate Superintendent
 for Instructional Support

Carl Fox
 Purchasing Manager

Alvina Garner
 Purchasing Technician

Teaching Effectively - Learning Successfully

September 27, 2010

To: Board of Trustees
 From: Alex Ayers *Alex Ayers*
 Re: **Award of Bid for New Floor Scrubbers**

The following bids were received:

Bidder	Item #1 32" for SV	Item #2 32" for CCHS	Option #1 28" Scrubber	Option #2 24" Scrubber	Option #3 Chariot 24"
AAA Solution	\$14,997.00	\$15,117.00	\$14,997.00	\$13,935.00	\$14,035.00
Bruco, Inc	\$12,095.95	\$14,255.95	\$13,445.95	No Bid	No Bid
Gases Plus	\$11,832.54	\$13,990.00	\$11,296.29	No Bid	No Bid
Heartland Paper	\$11,196.80	\$12,628.40	\$10,184.80	\$9,783.82	No Bid
Hillyard Floor Care	\$10,499.00	No Bid	\$10,290.00	No Bid	\$10,092.00*
House of Clean	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11,721.00
Knapp Supply	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10,718.00

Notes: After reviewing bids 32" machines were chosen for both locations.

*Hillyard is the sole authorized distributor for Chariot Machines in our region.

Recommendation:

Award Item #1 to Hillyard Floor Care in the amount of \$10,499.00.

Award Item #2 to Heartland Paper Company in the amount of \$12,628.40.