



1000 West Eighth Street – P.O. Box 3033 – Gillette, Wyoming 82717-3033
 (307) 682-5171 – Fax: (307) 682-6619

Teaching Effectively - Learning Successfully

Boyd Brown, Ed.D.
 Superintendent of Schools

Kirby Eisenhauer
 Associate Superintendent
 for Instructional Support

Carl Fox
 Purchasing Manager

Alvina Garner
 Purchasing Technician

January 19, 2017

To: Board of Trustees

From: Kirby Eisenhauer *Kirby Eisenhauer*
 Associate Superintendent for Instructional Support

Re: **Award of bid for Thunder Basin High School—FF&E #2**

Based on the bids received recommend award items as follows:

	Powder River Office	Source Office	Virco Corp.	Wyoming Office Products	TOP Office Products
Double & Single Pedestal Desks	\$36,704.00	\$37,855.93	No Bid	\$39,716.31	\$39,561.00
Student Chair/Desk Combos	No Bid	\$65,750.10	No Bid	\$57,891.60	\$60,450.00
Student Desks	No Bid	\$35,415.52	No Bid	\$31,610.70	\$29,355.00
Student Chairs	No Bid	\$35,978.58	\$30,882.06	\$37,760.58	No Bid
Multi Purpose Chairs	\$6,300.00	\$7,426.20	No Bid	\$7,412.10	\$7,320.00
Staff Chairs	\$10,212.00	\$10,258.00	No Bid	\$10,544.12	\$10,488.00
Guest Chairs	\$7,942.00	\$7,637.24	No Bid	\$7,514.88	\$8,360.00
2 & 4 Drawer File Cabinets	\$26,155.00	\$22,052.10	No Bid	\$30,218.94	\$27,951.00
Fireproof File Cabinets	\$36,000.00	\$37,232.16	No Bid	\$42,109.56	\$36,252.00
Four Shelf Bookcase	\$299.99	\$282.40	No Bid	\$294.15*	\$305.00
Five Shelf Bookcases	\$8,932.00	\$9,196.88	No Bid	\$9,579.64	\$9,940.00
Conference Tables	\$3,345.00	\$3,419.78	No Bid	\$2,268.90	\$3,202.00
Round & Rectangular Tables	No Bid	\$47,020.29	No Bid	\$43,455.04	\$39,065.50
Subtotal of awarded items	\$98,148.00	\$22,052.10	\$30,882.06	\$67,969.53	\$68,420.50

*Vendor is allowed a 5% preference for being an in state vendor.

Total amount for all awarded items \$287,292.19.