

1000 West Eighth Street – P.O. Box 3033 – Gillette, Wyoming 82717-3033
 (307) 682-5171 – Fax: (307) 682-6619

Boyd Brown, Ed.D.
 Superintendent of Schools


Kirby Eisenhauer
 Associate Superintendent
 for Instructional Support

Carl Fox
 Purchasing Manager

Alvina Garner
 Purchasing Technician

Teaching Effectively - Learning Successfully

April 20, 2017

To: Board of Trustees
 From: Kirby Eisenhauer 
 Associate Superintendent for Instructional Support

Re: **Award of bid for Thunder Basin High School – Cheerleading Sports Package**

Based on bids received recommend to award items as follows:

Item	Bush Wells	Cole Sports	Dakota Sports	Rebel Athletic	Universal Athletic	Varsity Spirit Fashion
Cheer Mat	\$7,350.00	\$7,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,165.00	No Bid
Uniforms	No Bid	\$1,664.00	\$1,397.12	\$2,000.00	\$2,160.00	\$1,920.00
Cold Weather Warm-Ups	\$3,016.00	\$1,216.00	\$3,072.00	No Bid	\$1,848.00	\$2,320.00
Warm Weather Warm-Ups	\$1,085.60	\$1,216.00	\$1,108.80	No Bid	\$1,040.00	\$1,360.00
Duffel Bags	\$776.00	\$640.00	\$624.00	No Bid	\$720.00	\$688.00
Pom Poms	No Bid	\$400.00	No Bid	\$504.00	\$240.00	\$240.00
Medical Bag	No Bid	\$60.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$65.00	No Bid

Notes: Universal, Cole Sports and Bush Wells are in state vendors and are allowed a 5% preference over other vendors.

Uniforms and Cold Weather Warm-Ups from Cole Sports were an alternate and did not meet requested specifications.

Dakota Sports is not an authorized distributor for uniforms bid.

Total for all awarded items: \$13,153.00.