



1000 West Eighth Street • P.O. Box 3033 • Gillette, Wyoming 82717-3033  
Office: (307) 682-5171 Fax: (307) 682-6619


Teaching Effectively - Learning Successfully

**Boyd Brown, Ed.D.**  
Superintendent of Schools

**Kirby Eisenhauer**  
Associate Superintendent  
for Instructional Support

**Carl Fox**  
Purchasing Manager

May 3, 2018

To: Board of Trustees  
From: Kirby Eisenhauer   
Associate Superintendent for Instructional Support

Re: **Award of Bid for Music Instruments**

The following bids were received:

	<b>Haggerty's Musicworks</b>	<b>Taylor Music, Inc.</b>
<b>2SP Flute (10)</b>	No Bid	<b>\$3,390.00</b>
<b>Bb Clarinet (10)</b>	<b>\$4,420.00</b>	\$4,450.00
<b>Alto Saxophone (10)</b>	<b>\$10,780.00</b>	\$10,840.00
<b>Trumpet (10)</b>	<b>\$4,850.00</b>	\$4,890.00
<b>Rotary Tuba</b>	No Bid	<b>\$8,500.00</b>
<b>Professional Bb Clarinet</b>	No Bid	<b>\$2,930.00</b>
<b>Soprano Saxophone</b>	<b>\$1,884.00</b>	\$1,893.00
<b>Professional Tenor Saxophone</b>	No Bid	<b>\$2,592.00</b>
<b>Professional Alto Saxophone</b>	No Bid	<b>\$2,402.00</b>

Funding Source: General Fund.

**Recommendation: Award Bb Clarinets, Alto Saxophones, Trumpets and Soprano Saxophone to Haggerty's Musicworks in the amount of \$21,934.00. Award Rotary Tuba, Professional Clarinet and Professional Saxophones to Taylor Music, Inc. in the amount of \$19,814.00. Total bid award is \$41,748.00.**